User	Date	Description	Rate/ Unit Price	Labor Time/ Quantity	Bill Amt/ Sell Price
Schuyler Schwartz	08/12/2024	Conference regarding smart ı	\$310.00 hr	0.20	\$62.00
Schuyler Schwartz	08/16/2024	Research regarding EMF opt	\$310.00 hr	2.80	\$868.00
Alex Mog	08/17/2024	Analyze whether removal of neighbor's smart meter is a reasonable accommodation request.	\$330.00 hr	0.40	\$132.00
Alex Mog	08/19/2024	Continue to analyze accommodation request regarding smart water meter.	\$330.00 hr	0.20	\$66.00
Alex Mog	08/19/2024	Review PFAS Settlements with Tyco and BASF for application to Sebastopol.	\$330.00 hr	0.40	\$132.00
Schuyler Schwartz Alex Mog	08/19/2024 08/22/2024	Correspondence regarding El Continue analysis of reasonable accommodation request related to smart water meters.	\$310.00 hr \$330.00 hr	0.10 0.30	\$0.00 \$99.00
Schuyler Schwartz Schuyler Schwartz	08/26/2024 08/27/2024	Conference regarding EMF qu Continue to analyze ability to opt out of water meter program due to EMF	\$310.00 hr \$310.00 hr	0.30 1.50	\$93.00 \$465.00
Alex Mog	09/02/2024	sensitivity. Review and analyze information regarding PFAS settlement agreement with Tyco and BASF; Email Mary Gourley and Dante Del Prete regarding same.	\$395.00 hr	0.40	\$158.00
Alex Mog	09/10/2024	Review details of PFAS settle	\$395.00 hr	0.30	\$118.50
Alex Mog	09/13/2024	Email City Council regarding closed session to discuss PFAS settlements.	\$395.00 hr	0.40	\$158.00
Alex Mog	09/17/2024	Review additional information regarding potential accommodation request related to smart meter.	\$330.00 hr	0.40	\$132.00

Alex Mog	09/19/2024	Coordinate process to opt-ou	\$395.00 hr	0.40	\$158.00
Alex Mog	10/01/2024	Phone call with outside counsel Greg Newmark regarding Well 4 settlement background.	\$395.00 hr	0.80	\$316.00
Alex Mog	11/21/2024	Analyze options for assigning duties to public works superintendent to public works director/city engineer.	\$330.00 hr	0.20	\$66.00
Alex Mog	11/22/2024	Review notice from court regarding Tyco & BASF PFAS settlements; email Don Schwartz regarding same.	\$395.00 hr	0.20	\$79.00
Alex Mog	12/05/2024	Attend meeting regarding Well 4 with Water Board and interested parties.	\$395.00 hr	0.50	\$197.50
Alex Mog	02/06/2025	Attend meeting with Regional Water Board and interested parties regarding Dry Cleaners/Well Cleanup.	\$395.00 hr	0.50	\$197.50
Alex Mog	02/07/2025	Phone call with outside counsel Greg Newmark regarding Well 4 matters.	\$395.00 hr	0.20	\$79.00
Alex Mog	02/12/2025	Review whether public hearing is necessary for Ordinance amending Title 13.	\$330.00 hr	0.20	\$66.00
Alex Mog	03/06/2025	Email correspondence with City Council regarding new legal services agreement for Well #4 Matter and related issues.	\$395.00 hr	0.30	\$118.50
Alex Mog Alex Mog	03/10/2025 03/11/2025	Review contract and assignm Prepare for and attend meeting with Councilmember Carter regarding Well #4	\$395.00 hr \$395.00 hr	0.20 0.70	\$79.00 \$276.50
Alex Mog	03/18/2025	Review and revise agenda documents for second readying of ordinance for Basis of Sewer Service and Policy 94 changes	\$330.00 hr	0.30	\$99.00
Alex Mog	03/23/2025	Email correspondence with Greg Newmark regarding Well#4 discussions with regional board.	\$395.00 hr	0.20	\$79.00

Alex Mog	04/02/2025	Email correspondence regarding funding for Well #4 Design RFP in FY 25-26.	\$395.00 hr	0.20	\$79.00
Alex Mog	04/03/2025	Attend meeting with Water Board and related parties regarding Well #4.	\$395.00 hr	0.40	\$158.00
Alex Mog	04/07/2025	Email correspondence with Greg Newmark regarding Well #4 negotiations.	\$395.00 hr	0.30	\$118.50
Alex Mog	04/29/2025	Prepare for and attend meeting with Greg Newmark and staff regarding Well #4 funding negotiations.	\$395.00 hr	0.70	\$276.50

\$4,926.50